
MONDAY, AUGUST 27, 1990, CONTINUED 

1. Holman Seed $28,544.60 total 

2. Nick Knott Turf Supply $29,376.00 total 

3. Horn Wholesale, Inc. $26,861.45 total 

4. Oklahoma Turf & Irrigation $1,562.50 tatal 

5. Paul Blakeney Company $14,371.00 total 

Moved by Selph, seconded by Harris, to refer bids to Parks and Purchasing for 

analysis, report and recommendation on September 4, 1990. Upon roll call, 

Selph, yes; Harris, yes; Rice, yes. Motion carried. 

Sealed bids, on behalf of all Tulsa County Departments, for Request for 

Proposal on Blanket Bond for all Tulsa County Employees were received and 

opened. The bidder being one in number is as follows: 

1. Sedgwick/James $2,742.00 total 

Moved by Selph, seconded by Harris, to refer bids to Purchasing for analysis, 

report and recommendation on September 4, 1990. Upon roll call, Selph, yes; 

Harris, yes; Rice, yes. Motion carried. 

Sealed bids, on behalf of all Tulsa County Maintenance Garages, for 

Automotive Paint and Body Supplies were received and opened. The bidders being 

three in number are as follow: 

1. Davis Auto Color by item 

2. Jim Sesow Auta Paint & Supply Co. by item 

3. Manger Pro Color, Inc. by item 

Moved by Selph, seconded by Harris, to refer bids to Purchasing for analysis, 

report and recommendation on September 4, 1990. Upon roll call, Selph, yes} 

Harris, yes; Rice, yes. Motion carried. 

Sealed bids, on behalf of Sheriff, for New Computer Equipment and Software 

were received and opened. The bidders being sixteen in number are as follow: 

1. Infocel no bid 
2. Computer Gear/Office Gear no bid 

3. Buddy Stone & Associates, Inc. no bid 
4. Illinois Computer Leasing Carp. no bid 
5. Sumit Computer Corp. no bid 
&. Harris/Lanier noe bid 

7. jgenith Data Systems no bid 

8. Today's Computer Business Center $3,892.61 total 

9. MicroAge Computer Store $3,869.00 total 

10.Profile Distributing $4,859.00 total 
11.Business Computer Centers $3,543.95 total 

12.Inter Data Systems, Inc. $2,969.00 total 

13.Computerland $3,637.00 total 
14.Schaefer Enterprises & Assocs. $3,769.00 total 

15.Software City $2,175.00 total 
16.Business Computer Center $2,479.00 total 

Moved by Selph, seconded by Harris, to refer bids to Sheriff and Purchasing for 

analysis, report and recommendation on September 4, 1990. Upon roll call, 

Selph, yes; Harris, yes; Rice, yes. Motion carried. 

Sealed bids, on behalf of Tulsa County Retirement Board, for Request of 

Proposal for Actuarial Consulting Service were received and opened. The bidders 

being two in number are as follow: 

1. Thomas E. Cummins by item 

2. William M. Mercer, Inc. by item 

Moved by Selph, seconded by Harris, to refer bids to Tulsa County Retirement 

Board, Dave Bercaw and Purchasing for analysis, report and recommendation on 


