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Monday, June 17, 2002 - Continued

Sealed bids for Two (2) New Sickle Bar Mowers, One (1) New Bobcat Stump Grinder

Attachment, One (1) New Five (5) Gang Tow Behind Mower, One (1) New Utility Vehicle, One (1) New

Trailer Mounted Sprayer were received and opened. The bidders being six (6) in number are as

follow:

1.
2.

Enlow Tractor no bid (Clerk’s Misc. File No. 185241)

Enlow Tractors, Inc. unit price Sickle Bar Bower $3,635.00
unit price Stump Grinder $4,622.00
no bid 5 Gang reel mower
unit price Kawasaki Mule util. veh. $5,537.00
unit price trailer mounted sprayer $4,589.00

, (Clerk’s Misc. File No. 185242)
Green Country Ag & Lawn no bid Sickle Bar Mower
' unit price Stump Grinder $6,345.00

unit price 5 Gang reel mower $14,914.00
unit price Utility Vehicle $4,585.68
unit price trailer mounted sprayer $4,825.00
(Clerk’s Misc. File No. 185243)

Professional Turf Products no bid Sickle Bar Mower
no bid Stump Grinder
unit price 5 Gang Reel Mower $12,569.00
unit price Utility Vehicle $5,490.68
unit price trailer mounted sprayer $5,681.00
(Clerk’s Misc. File No. 185244)

Stillwater Equipment Affidavit for Competitive Bid not completed.
(Clerk’s Misc. File No. 185245)

White Star Machinery & Supply  Affidavit for Competitive Bid not completed.
(Clerk’s Misc. File No. 185246)

Moved by Collins, seconded by Dick, to refer the bids to Parks and Purchasing for analysis,

report and recommendation before the end of this meeting. Upon roll call, Collins, yes; Dick, yes.

Motion carried.

Sealed bids for Glock Handguns and Leather Duty Gear were received and opened. The

bidders being six (6) in number are as follow:

1.

SRl ol

21st Century Hard Armor

Protection, Inc. no bid (Clerk’s Misc. File No. 185247)
FBF, Inc. by item (Clerk’s Misc. File No. 185248}
Glock, Inc. by item (Clerk’s Misc. File No. 185249)
Don Hume Leathergoods by item (Clerk’s Misc. File No. 185250)
Law Enforcement Equipment Co. no bid (Clerk’s Misc. File No. 185251)
Ray O’Herron Co., Inc. by item (Clerk’s Misc. File No. 185252)

Moved by Collins, seconded by Dick, to refer the bids to Sheriff and Purchasing for analysis,

report and recommendation on June 24, 2002. Upon roll call, Collins, yes; Dick, yes. Motion

carried.

Moved by Collins, seconded by Dick, to approve the following bid recommendations and

awards:

1.

CC Health - One (1) New Land Pride All Flex Grooming Mower, Model AFM4011 or Equal to
Green Country Ag & Lawn Equipment in the total amount of $8,420.00, including trade-in
specified, the lowest & best bid received. The bid from Kelley's ($8,197.66) did not meet
specifications for a rear remote. (Clerk’s Misc. File No. 185253)

Engineers - One (1) New HP 800ps Plotter to J.D. Young in the total amount of $7,695.00,
the lowest bid received and it includes a 5-year warranty package. (Clerk’s Misc. File No.
185254)

Highways - Lease Purchase of Motor Graders to be deferred.

Highways - Reflective Glass Beads to Flex-O-Lite, Inc. at $0.226 per Ib., the lowest bid
received. This award is for 1 year beginning 6/17/02. (Clerk’s Misc. File No. 185255)
Highways - Traffic Marking Paint to Ennis Paint, Inc. at $4.02/white and $4.06/yellow,
the lowest bid received. This award is for 1 year beginning 6/17/02. (Clerk’s Misc. File No.
185256)

INCOG on behalf of Liberty Area Fire Protection Assoc. - Wildland Gear to be deferred.




