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WEDNESDAY, APRIL 23, 1986 CONTINUED

Moved by Harris, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to Purchasing and Engineers
for analysis, report and recommendation on April 28, 1986. Upon roll call,
Harris, yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried.

‘Sealed bids, on behalf of District Attorney, for Six (6) Trunk-Mount VHF-
FM 80 Watt Radios and Related Accessories were received and opened. The bidders
. being two in number are as follow:

l. CES Two-Way Communications Total $10,085.00

2. McCaw Communications Co., MSI Division
Total $11,505.00

Moved by Harris, seconded by Selph, to refer bids -to District Attormney for
analysis, report and recommendation on April 28, 1986. Upon roll call, Harris,
yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids, on behalf of Highway, for (1) New Heavy Duty Flail Mower were

received and opened. The bidders being six in number are as follow:

1. Midwestern Equipment co. No bid
2. Alamo Group No bid
3. Enlow Ford Tractor No bid
4., Milner Equipment Co. $3,300.00
5. Kelly Lawn & Garden $3,300.00
6. Tulsa Tractor Co., Inc. $2,183.00

Moved by Harris, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to Engineers and Purchasing
for analysis, report and recommendation on April 28, 1986. Upon roll call,
Harris, yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids, on behalf of Highway, for (11) New Rotary Mowers were received

and opened. The bidders being six in number are as follow:
1. New Holland Tulsa Unit $1,576.30 Total $17,339.30
2. Enlow Ford Tractor Unit $1,321.60 Total $14,537.60
Alternate Unit $1,651.20 Total $18,163.20
3. Stockyards Equip. & Supply Unit $1,560.00 Total $17,160.00
Alternate Unit $1,357.00 Total $14,927.00
4, Midwestern Equipment Co. No bid

Keystone'Equipment Co., Inc. No bid

6. Tulsa Tractor Unit $1,447.00 Total $15,917.00
Alternate , Unit $1,468.00 Total $16,148.00

Moved by Harris, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to Engineers and Purchasing
for analysis, report and recommendation on April 28, 1986. Upon roll call,
Harris, yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids, on behalf of Superintendent of Schools, for (3) New Frig-
idaire Window Air Conditioner Units were received and opened. The bidders being
two in number are as follow:

1. Reeves TV & Appliances Unit $632.00 Total $1,896.00
2. AES of Tulsa Unit $745.00 Total $2,235.00

Moﬁed by Harris, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to SuperintendentAof Schools
and Purchasing for analysis, report and recommendation on April 28, 1986. Upon
roll call, Harris, yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried.

Moved by Harris, seconded by Selph, on behalf of all Tulsa County depart-

ments, to.approve the bid award for cleaning pads to Eve, Incorporated for a




