(Agenda of meeting was posted in the Administration Building Lobby on February 9, 2005 at 4:56
p.m.)

MINUTES
Tuesday, February 15, 2005

The Board of County Commissioners for Tulsa County met at the hour of 10:00 a.m. with the
following members present: Robert N. Dick, Chairman; Wilbert E. Collins, Sr., Member, and Earlene
Wilson, Tulsa County Clerk. Randi Miller, Member, was absent.

Robert N. Dick, Chairman, presiding, called the meeting to order at 10:00 a.m., and the
following business was transacted:

NOTICE: A complete listing of all information relating to the following bids is on file and
available for public inspection in the offices of County Purchasing and County Clerk.

Sealed bids for Earthwork were received and opened. The bidders being two (2) in number are
as follow:

1. Carter Excavating, Inc. total bid price $ 207,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196321)
2. Cherokee Builders, Inc. total bid price $411,800.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196322)

Sealed bids for Site Utilities were received and opened. The bidders being two (2) in number
are as follow:

1. Carter Excavating, Inc. total bid price $ 202,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196323)
2. Cherokee Builders, Inc. total bid price $294,900.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196324)

Sealed bids for Site Concrete were received and opened. The bidders being two (2) in number
are as follow:

1. Carter Excavating, Inc. total bid price $ 113,333.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196325)
2. Cherokee Builders, Inc. total bid price $285,400.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196326)

Sealed bids for Asphalt Paving were received and opened. The bidders being two (2) in number
are as follow:

1. Dunham's Asphalt Services Inc total bid price $ 186,450.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196327)
2. Ellsworth Paving total bid price $ 132,591.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196328)
No bids for Chain Link Fencing were received.

Sealed bids for Pavement Markings and Precast Parking Bumpers were received and opened.
The bidders being two (2) in number are as follow:

1. A-1 Striping, Inc. total bid price $ 10,065.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196329)
2. Ellsworth Paving total bid price $ 3,659.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196330)

Sealed bids for Landscaping were received and opened. The bidders being seven (7) in number
are as follow:

1. AAA Landscape of Tulsa, Inc. total bid price $ 113,304.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196331)
2. Cox Landscape Co., Inc. total bid price $ 137,340.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196332)
3. Kelly Design, Inc. total bid price $101,178.42
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196333)
4. Maple Lee Tree Service total bid price $ 64,500.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196334)
5. Northeastern Irrigation & Landscape, total price $ 71,000.00
Inc. (Clerk's Misc. File No. 196335)
6. Regional Irrigation Inc. total bid price $ 93,800.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196336)
7. Tierra Concepts Landscape total bid price $ 77,581.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196337)
Sealed bids for Irrigation were received and opened. The bidders being four (4)
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in number are as follow:

1. AAA Landscape of Tulsa, Inc. total bid price $ 69,164.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196338)
2. Cox Landscape Co., Inc. total bid price $ 137,340.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196339)

3. Northeastern Irrigation & Landscape, total bid price $ 52,900.00

Inc. (Clerk's Misc. File No. 196340)

4. Regional Irrigation Inc. total bid price $ 54,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196341)

Sealed bids for Termite Treatment were received and opened. The bidder being one (1) in
number is as follows:
1. Arrow Exterminators, Inc. total bid price $ 4,500.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196342)
No bids for Site Furnishings -Alternate were received

Sealed bids for Cast-In-Place Concrete were received and opened. The bidders being two (2) in
number are as follow:

1. Cantera Concrete Co. LLC total bid price $ 525,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196343)
2. Lithko Contracting, Inc. total bid price $ 361,400.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196344)

Sealed bids for Masonry were received and opened. The bidders being two (2) in number are as
follow:

1. Brazeal Masonry, Inc. total bid price $ 288,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196345)
2. R. B. Weatherman Masonry, Inc. total bid price $ 372,000.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 1963406)

Sealed bids for Steel Package were received and opened. The bidders being three (3) in number
are as follow:

1. Bennett Steel, Inc. total bid price $1,315,475.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196347)
2. Builders Steel Co., Inc. total bid price $1,387,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196348)
3. The Railroad Yard, Inc. no bid (Clerk's Misc. File No. 196349)

Sealed bids for Architectural Woodwork and Casework were received and opened. The bidders
being three (3) in number are as follow:

1. Heartland Casework, Inc. total bid price $ 174,465.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196350)
2. MGC, Inc./Max Grigsby Co., Inc. total bid price $ 192,135.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196351)
3. Wood Systems, Inc. total bid price $ 177,686.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196352)

Sealed bids for Waterproofing and Caulking were received and opened. The bidders being two
(2) in number are as follow:

1. Commercial Waterproofing LLC Affidavit of Non-collusion not included
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196353)
2. Trey Waterproofing Affidavit of Non-collusion not included

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196354)

Sealed bids for Membrane Roofing were received and opened. The bidders being three (3) in
number are as follow:

1. Oklahoma Roofing and Sheet Metal, total bid price $ 310,000.00
Inc. (Clerk's Misc. File No. 196355)

2. Standard Roofing Company, Inc. total bid price $ 226,500.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196356)

3. Turner Roofing and Sheet Metal, Inc. total bid price $ 278,560.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196357)

Sealed bids for Standing Seam Roofing were received and opened. The bidders being three (3)
in number are as follow:

1. Oklahoma Roofing and Sheet Metal, total bid price $ 310,000.00
Inc. (Clerk's Misc. File No. 196358)

2. Standard Roofing Company, Inc. total bid price $ 95,500.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196359)

3. Turner Roofing and Sheet Metal, Inc. total bid price $ 278,560.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196360)
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Sealed bids for Roof Hatches (Material) were received and opened. The bidder being one (1) in
number are as follow:
1. Murray Womble, Inc. total bid price $ 4,032.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196361)

Sealed bids for Steel Doors & Frames (Material) were received and opened. The bidders being
two (2) in number are as follow:

1. Builder’s Supply, Inc. total bid price $ 24,900.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196362)
2. Murray Womble, Inc. total bid price $ 22,297.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196363)

Sealed bids for Flush Wood Doors (Material) were received and opened. The bidders being four
(4) in number are as follow:

1. Murray Womble, Inc. total bid price $ 39,461.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196364)

2. Precision Door & Window, Inc. total bid price $ 33,500.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196365)

3. Windor Supply & Mfg., Inc. total bid price $ 37,526.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 1963606)

4. Wood Systems, Inc. total bid price $ 33,351.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196367)

Sealed bids for Overhead Doors were received and opened. The bidders being two (2) in
number are as follow:

1. Murray Womble, Inc. total bid price $ 4,224.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196368)
2. Overhead Door Co. of Tulsa, Inc. total bid price $ 4,101.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196369)

Sealed bids for Glass Systems were received and opened. The bidders being five (5) in number
are as follow:

1. Advantage Glass, Inc. total bid price $ 557,900.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196370)

2. American Glass & Metal, Inc. total bid price $ 805,410.00
Clerk's Misc. File No. 196371)

3. Downtown Glass, Inc. total bid price $ 645,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196372)

4. High-Tech-Tronics alt #22 $ 35,701.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196373)

S. Horner Glass, Inc. total bid price $611,500.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196374)

Sealed bids for Door Hardware (Material) were received and opened. The bidders being three
(3) in number are as follow:

1. Builder’s Supply, Inc. total bid price $ 50,500.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196375)

2. Murray Womble, Inc. total bid price $ 43,075.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196376)

3. Scovil & Sides Hardware Co. total bid price $ 47,387.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196377)

Sealed bids for Door and Hardware Installation were received and opened. The bidders being
three (3) in number are as follow:

1. Builder’s Supply, Inc. total bid price $ 23,500.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196378)

2. Murray Womble, Inc. total bid price $ 93,910.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196379)

3. Rekab Builders LTD. total bid price $ 26,000

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196380)

Sealed bids for Gypsum Board Assemblies were received and opened. The bidders being two (2)
in number are as follow:

1. Green Country Interiors, Inc. total bid price $ 547,700.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196381)
2. Midwest Drywall Co., Inc. total bid price $ 579,820.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196382)

Sealed bids for Acoustical Panel Ceilings were received and opened. The bidders being four (4)
in number are as follow:

1. Charlton Construction Co. total bid price $ 93,038.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196383)
2. Green Country Interiors, Inc. total bid price $ 79,700.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196384)
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3. Midwest Drywall Co., Inc. total bid price $ 100,750.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196385)
4. Sooner Ceilings total bid price $ 82,700.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 1963806)

Sealed bids for Acoustical Wall Panels were received and opened. The bidders being three (3) in
number are as follow:

1. Green Country Interiors, Inc. total bid price $ 4,370.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196387)

2. Midwest Drywall Co., Inc. total bid price $ 3,300.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196388)

3. Tulsa Window Treatments total bid price $ 3,500.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196389)

Sealed bids for FRP Panels were received and opened. The bidder being one (1) in number is as
follows:
1. Green Country Interiors, Inc. total bid price $ 1,700.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196390)

Sealed bids for Terrazzo were received and opened. The bidder being one (1) in number is as
follows:
1. Southern Terrazzo Co. total bid price $ 94,350.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196391)

Sealed bids for Ceramic Tile were received and opened. The bidders being four (4) in number
are as follow:
1. Carpet Supply Company total bid price $ 4,437.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196392)
2. Commercial Window Coverings, Inc. total bid price $ 1,900.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196393)

3. Grigsby’s Carpet & Tile total bid price $ 3,254.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196394)
4. Wood Systems, Inc. total bid price $ 3,691.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196395)

Sealed bids for Carpet and Resilient Flooring were received and opened. The bidders being four
(4) in number are as follow:
1. Carpet Supply Company total bid price $ 131,697.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196396)
2. Commercial Window Coverings, Inc. total bid price $ 125,900.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196397)

3. Grigsby’s Carpet & Tile total bid price $ 134,603.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196398)
4. Wood Systems, Inc. total bid price $ 123,000.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196399)

Sealed bids for Painting & Wall Coverings were received and opened. The bidders being two (2)
in number are as follow:

1. Charlton Construction Co. total bid price $ 155,800.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196400)
2. Bob Turner Painting total bid price $ 146,000.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196401)

Sealed bids for Visual Display Boards (Material) -Alternate were received and opened. The
bidder being one (1) in number is as follows:
1. Murray Womble, Inc. alt # 18 $ 5,838.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196402)

Sealed bids for Toilet Partitions (Material) were received and opened. The bidders being two (2)
in number are as follow:

1. Builder’s Supply, Inc. total bid price $ 3,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196403)
2. Murray Womble, Inc. total bid price $ 2,589.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196404)

Sealed bids for Impact Resistant Wall Protection (Material) were received and opened. The
bidders being one (1) in number are as follow:
1. Dave Maher & Associates, Inc. total bid price $ 2,562.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196405)

Sealed bids for Identification Devices were received and opened. The bidders being four (4) in
number are as follow:
1. Amax Sign Co. total bid price $ 108,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196406)
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2. Architectural Graphics, Inc. total bid price $ 87,592.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196407)

3. Claude Neon Federal Signs total bid price $ 152,139.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196408)

4. J & B Graphics, Inc. total bid price $ 92,832.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196409)

Sealed bids for Lockers and Benches were received and opened. The bidders being two (2) in
number are as follow:

1. Builder’s Supply, Inc. total bid price $ 10,500.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196410)
2. Murray Womble, Inc. total bid price $ 10,042.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196411)

Sealed bids for Fire Protection Specialties (Material) were received and opened. The bidders
being two (2) in number are as follow:

1. Builder’s Supply, Inc. total bid price $ 3,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196412)
2. Fire Co of Oklahoma, Inc. total bid price $ 2,139.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196413)

Sealed bids for Cubicle Curtain & Track were received and opened. The bidders being four (4)
in number are as follow:
1. Builder’s Supply Inc. total bid price $ 2,600.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196414)
2. Commercial Window Coverings, Inc. total bid price $ 7,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196415)

3. Contract Drapery & Blind, Inc. total bid price $ 2,670.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196416)
4. Tulsa Window Treatments total bid price $ 1,500.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196417)

Sealed bids for Toilet & Bath Accessories (Material) were received and opened. The bidders
being two (2) in number are as follow:

1. Builder’s Supply Inc. total bid price $ 14,500.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196418)
2. Wood Systems, Inc. total bid price $ 12,550.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196419)

Sealed bids for Installation of Specialties were received and opened. The bidder being one (1) in
number is as follows:
1. Rekab Builders LTD. total bid price $ 36,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196420)

Sealed bids for Operable Partitions were received and opened. The bidders being two (2) in
number are as follow:

1. Architectural Materials Co. total bid price $ 21,400.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196421)
2. Murray Womble, Inc. total bid price $ 23,437.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196422)

Sealed bids for Food Service Equipment - Alternate were received and opened. The bidders
being three (3) in number are as follow:

1. Amundsen Food Equipment total bid price $ 31,967.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196423)

2. Curtis Restaurant Supply & total bid price $ 37,043.00
Equipment Co./Platinum Ventures, (Clerk's Misc. File No. 196424)
Inc.

3. Supreme Fixture, Inc. alt # 16 $ 32,600.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196425)
No bids for Residential Appliances were received and opened.

Sealed bids for Window Treatments (Louvered Blinds and Window Shades) were received and
opened. The bidders being four (4) in number are as follow:
1. Commercial Window Coverings, Inc total bid price $ 10,500.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196426)

2. Contract Drapery & Blind Inc. total bid price $ 6,662.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196427)
3. Specialty Sales Associates, Inc. total bid price $ 22,735.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196428)
4. Tulsa Window Treatments total bid price $ 7,500.00
alt # 17 $ 13,200.00 (Clerk's

Misc. File No. 196429)
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Sealed bids for Elevators were received and opened. The bidders being three (3) in number are
as follow:

1. Kone, Inc. total bid price $ 81,700.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196430)

2. Otis Elevators Company total bid price $ 87,424.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196431)

3. Schindler Elevator Corporation total bid price $ 67,675.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196432)

Sealed bids for Fire Protection (Sprinkler) System were received and opened. The bidders being
four (4) in number are as follow:

1. SimplexGrinnell LP total bid price $ 94,469.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196433)

2. Jayhawk Fire Sprinklers Co., Inc. total bid price $ 139,800.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196434)

3. Mac Systems, Inc. total bid price $ 81,198.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196435)

4. Superior Fire Protection, Inc. total bid price $ 180,600.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196436)

Sealed bids for Mechanical Package were received and opened. The bidders being three (3) in
number are as follow:

1. MeclIntosh Services, Inc. total bid price $ 2,584,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196437)

2. Omni-2 Mechanical Services Affidavit of Non-collusion not included
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196438)

3. Palmer Plumbing, Heating & Air total bid price $ 2,310,000.00
Conditioning Co., Inc. (Clerk's Misc. File No. 196439)

Sealed bids for Final Cleaning were received and opened. The bidders being two (2) in number
are as follow:

1. J & J Construction Clean-Up total bid price $ 39,000.00
Company (Clerk's Misc. File No. 196440)
2. Jani-King of Tulsa total bid price $ 5,625.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196441)

Sealed bids for Periodic Building Clean-up were received and opened. The bidders being three
(3) in number are as follow:

1. J & J Construction Clean-Up total bid price $ 25,000.00
Company (Clerk's Misc. File No. 196442)
2. Jani-King of Tulsa $ 17.00/hr for Supervisor

$ 15.00/hr for Laborer
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196443)
3. Kingdom Alarms LLC $ 38.00/hr for Supervisor
$ 20.00/hr for Laborer
$ 16.00/hr for Helper
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196444)

Sealed bids for Periodic Site Maintenance and Clean-up were received and opened. The bidders

being two (2) in number are as follow:

1. J & J Construction Clean-Up total bid price $ 25,000.00
Company (Clerk's Misc. File No. 196445)
2. Kingdom Alarms LLC $ 38.00/hr for Supervisor

$ 20.00/hr for Laborer

$ 16.00/hr for Helper

$ 62.00/hr Bob-Cat

$ 92.00/hr Dump Truck

$ 74.00/hr Back-hoe
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196446)

Sealed bids for Wood Blocking/Backing for Medical Equipment and Furniture were received
and opened. The bidder being one (1) in number is as follows:
1. Rekab Builders LTD total bid price $ 20,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196447)

Sealed bids for Portland Cement Plaster (Stucco) were received and opened. The bidder being
one (1) in number is as follows:
1. Green Country Interiors, Inc. total bid price $4,770.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196448)

Sealed bids for Security System were received and opened. The bidders being five (5) in
number are as follow:
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1. 22rdCentury Environments, Inc. no bid (Clerk's Misc. File No. 196449)

2. High-Tech-Tronics alt # 20 $ 100,010.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196450)

3. Kingdom Alarms LLC total bid price $ 89,460.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196451)

4. Travis Voice and Data total bid price $ 14,929.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196452)

5. York Electronic Systems, Inc. total bid price $ 130,772.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196453)

Sealed bids for Clock System were received and opened. The bidders being two (2) in number
are as follow:

1. High-Tech-Tronics alt # 21 $ 10,826.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196454)
2. Mac Systems, Inc. total bid price $ 12,855.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196455)

Sealed bids for Structured Communications, Data Network and Telephone Communication
System were received and opened. The bidders being seven (7) in number are as follow:

1. ISG Technology, Inc. total bid price $ 173,853.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196456)

2. Lanlynx, LLC total bid price $ 79,892.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196457)

3. Mac Systems, Inc. total bid price $ 140,386.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196458)

4. Infosys total bid price $ 324,624.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196459)

5. SBC total bid price $ 208,237.47
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196460)

6. Terra Telecom, Inc. Affidavit of Non-collusion not included
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196461)

7. Travis Voice and Data Affidavit of Non-collusion not included

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196462)

Sealed bids for Audio/Video System were received and opened. The bidders being two (2) in
number are as follow:

1. High-Tech-Tronics total bid price $ 9,670.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196463)
2. Terra Telecom, Inc. Affidavit of Non-collusion not included

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196464)

Sealed bids for Intercom System were received and opened. The bidders being two (2) in
number are as follow:

1. High-Tech-Tronics total bid price $ 15,625.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196465)
2. Travis Voice and Data total bid price $ 8,355.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196466)

Sealed bids for Fire Alarm System were received and opened. The bidders being six (6) in
number are as follow:

1. Automatic Protection Systems total bid price $ 34,00.00
Corporation (Clerk's Misc. File No. 196467)

2. Endex, Inc. of Tulsa total bid price $ 41,150.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196468)

3. High-Tech-Tronics total bid price $ 43,574.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196469)

4. Kingdom Alarms, LLC total bid price $ 59,220.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196470)

5. Mac Systems, Inc. total bid price $ 51,398.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196471)

6. York Electronic Systems, Inc. total bid price $ 55,739.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196472)

Sealed bids for Cable Television System were received and opened. The bidders being three (3)
in number are as follow:

1. High-Tech-Tronics total bid price $ 5,510.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196473)

2. Infosys total bid price $ 5,582.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196474)

3. Mac Systems, Inc. total bid price $ 35,639.00

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196475)
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Sealed bids for Electrical were received and opened. The bidders being five (5) in number are
as follow:
1. Alliance Electrical Contractors, Inc. total bid price $ 1,035,684.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196476)

2. Colburn Electric Co. total bid price $ 930,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196477)

3. Marrs Electric, Inc. total bid price $ 806,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196478)

4. Oil Capital Electric, LLC total bid price $ 826,000.00
(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196479)

5. W. W. Enterprises, Inc. Affidavit of Non-collusion not included

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196480)

Sealed no bids were received and opened. The bidders being four (4) in number are as follow:

1. Dant Clayton Corporation no bid

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196481)
2. Gaylord Bros. no bid

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196482)
3. Long Electronics no bid

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196483)
4. Tomar Enterprises, Inc. no bid

(Clerk's Misc. File No. 196484)
Moved by Collins, seconded by Dick, to refer the bids to Purchasing for analysis, report and
recommendation on February 28, 2005. Upon roll call, Collins, yes; Dick, yes. Motion carried.
Moved by Dick, seconded by Collins, that this meeting be recessed. Upon roll call, Collins, yes;
Dick, yes. Motion carried.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Robert N. Dick, Chairman
ATTEST:

Earlene Wilson, County Clerk
(DETAILS OF THE ABOVE ARE AVAILABLE IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY CLERK.)



