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MONDAY, JUNE 2, 1986 CONTINUED

1. All Seasons Rental § Supply

Gas Edgers $342.50 each
Trim Mowers with bagger no bid
Walk Power Mower no bid
2. Discount Mowers
Trim Mowers w/Bagger $550..00 each
Gas:_Edgers. .. .. = no bid
Walk Power Mower no bid
3. Bartlesville Cycle Sports
Trim Mower w/Bagger $404.00 each
4. Wait Sales Co.
Gas Edgers ’ $300.00 each
Walk Power Mower $3,400.00 each
Trim Mowers w/Bagger $365.00 each

Moved by Rice, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to Parks and Purchasing for analysis,
report and recommendation on June 9, 1986. Upon roll call, Rice, yes; Selph, vyes.
Motion carried.

Sealed bids, on behalf of Social Services, for Seventy-Five (75) Boxes of
4" NAFCO Vinyl Base Coving were received and opened. The bidders being five in

number are as follow:

1. C § C Tile § Carpet $2,321.37 Total
2. Midwestern Tile § Linoleum Co. $2,406.30 Total
3. Sherwin Williams Commercial $1,944.94 Total
4, R § R Carpet § Tile Co. $2,155.30 Total
5. International Floors : $2,086.50 Total

Moved by Rice, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to Social Services and Purchas-
ing for analysis, report and recommendation on June 9, 1986. Upon roll call, Rice,
yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids, on behalf of Parks, for Ten (10) New Nylon Tennis Nets, Five
(5) Rolls of Weathashade Windscreen and One (1) New AMF Vaulting Horse were received
and opened. The bidders being five in nﬁmbef are as follow:

1. Midwest Racquetball § Sporting Goods, Dist.

Tennis Nets $120.00 each
Weathashade no bid
Vaulting Horse $1,023.00

2. American Athletic Equipment
Vaulting Horse $1,259.00
Tennis Nets no bid
Weathashade no bid

3. Bucks Sporting Goods
Tennis Nets $93.95 each
Weathashade $443.25 per roll
Vaulting Horse $1,255.00

4. Continental Gym Supplies
Tennis Nets $89.00 each
Weathashade no bid
Vaulting Horse $990.00

5. BSN Corporation
Tennis Nets $65.02 each
Weathashade $217.00 per roll
Vaulting Horse no bid

(Affidavit of non-collusion not completed)
Moved by Rice, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to Parks ‘and Purchasing for analysis,
report and recommendation on June 9, 1986. Upon roll call, Rice, yes; Selph, vyes.

Motion carried.




