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MONDAY, JUNE 9, 1986, CONTINUED 

1. Jackie Cooper Warehouse §& Equipment Co. $1,395.00 
2. Easy Leasing of Oklahoma $1,544.75 
3. Randy Malchi Automotive Equipment $1,399.95 
4. Woodall Equipment $1,313.40 
5. FMC Automotive Service Equipment Division $1,313.40 

Moved by Rice, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to Engineers and Purchasing for 

analysis, report and recommendation on June 16, 1986. Upon roll call, Rice, 

yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried. 

Sealed bids, on behalf of Highways, Aluminum Sign Blanks and Reflective 

Sign Faces were received and opened. The bidders being seven in number are as 

follow: 

1. Zap Manufacturing Company by item 
2. Hall Signs Inc. by item 
3. Medley Material Handling by item 
4, Vulcan Signs by item 
5. Pinkley Sales Company by item 
6. U.S. Sign Enameling Corp. by item 
7. Unistrut no bid 

Moved by Rice, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to Engineers and Purchasing for 

analysis, report and recommendation on June 16, 1986. Upon roll call, Rice, 

yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried. 

Sealed bids, on behalf of Parks, for One (1) New Three Wheel Cart 

Equipped with Mounted Topdresser and One (1) New Fairway Spray Tank were received 

and opened. The bidders being four in number are as follow: 

1. Wait Sales $6,800.00 
Spray Tank $3,800.00 

2. Knott Turf Equipment Cart no bid 
Spray Tank $2,618.75 

3. Medley Material Handling No bid 
4, Paul Blakeney Cart No bid 

Spray Tank $5,030.00 

report and recommendation on June 16, 1986. Upon roll call, Rice, yes; Seiph, 

yes. Motion carried. 

Sealed bids, on behalf of Highways, for Twenty-four (24) Portable 

Traffic Counters were received and opened. The bidders being two in number are 

as follow: 

Moved by Rice, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to Parks and Purchasing for analysis, 

yes; Selph 
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Moved by Rice, seconded by Selph, to refer bids 

analysis, report and recommendation on June 16, 

» yes. Motion carried. 

Sealed bids, on behalf of Building Operations, 

s were received and opened. The 

Eve Incorporated 
Tulsa Maintenance Supply 

. Moulder-Oldham Company 
Modlin Recreation 

Operations for analysis, report and recommendation on June 16, 1986. 

1. K-Hill Signal Co., Inc. $155.00 each 
500' extra roadway tube $175.00 

2. Gades Sales Co., Inc. $230.00 each 
500' extra roadway tube $225.00 

to Highways and Purchasing for 

1986. Upon roll call, Rice, 

for Eight (8) Litter 

bidders being four in number are as 

$1,721.84 Total 
$2,152.00 Total 
$3,281.80 Total 
$2,352.00 Total 

Moved by Rice, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to Purchasing and Building 

Upon roll 


