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5. Malchi Auto Equipment
Engine Analyzer $ 2,906.25
Wheel Balancer 4,276.50
MoVed by Harris, seconded by Rice, to refer the bids to Building Operations and Purchasing for
analysis, report and recommendation on June 6, 1983. Upon roll call, Harris, yes; Rice, yes;

Young, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids, on behalf of Building Operations, for 1 horizontal metal cutoff bandsaw and

one 15" floor model drill press, were receiVed and opened. The bidders being seven in number
are as follows:

1. CK & W Supply

Bandsaw $ 3,053.10
Drill Press 1,240.00
2. Royal Machine Tools Inc.
Bandsaw $ 1,800.00
Drill Press 1,450.00
3. B & C Machinery .
Bandsaw $ 1,760.00
Drill Press 672.90
4. DoAll Tulsa Co. ‘
Bandsaw No Bid
Drill Press No Bid
5. Midwest Supply Co. o
Bandsaw .. NO Bid
Drill Press No Bid
6. Hart Industrial
Bandsaw - $ 2,295.00
Drill Press 1,034.00
7. Marsuco
Bandsaw $ 1,794.50
Drill Press 1,259.70

MoVed by Harris, seconded by Rice, to refer the bids to Building Operatioﬁs and Purchasing for
analysis, report and recaommendation on June 6, 1983. Upon rollrcallx., Harris, yes; Rice, ves;
Young, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids, on behalf of Building Operations, for ﬁacuum cleaner parts and equipment, were
receiVed and opened. The bidders being two iﬁ numnber are as follows:

1. Kirby Co. of Oklahoma by item
2. Bewley Sweeper Service by item-

MoVed by Harris, seconded by Rice, to refer the bids to Buildihg Operations and Purchasing for
analysis, report and recommendation on June 6, 1983. Upon roll call, Harris, yes; Rice, yes;
Young, yes. Motion ca.rried.

Sealed bids, on behalf of ﬁealth, for 1 new combustible gas/oxygen deficiency combination

detector, were received and opened. The bidders being three in number are as follows:

I 1. Briggs-Weaver $ 610.00
2. Wayest Safety Inc. 715.00
3. Boren/Zink Safety Inc. 625.00

l Moved 'by Rice, seconded by Harris, to refer the bids to Health and Purchasing for analysis,

report and recommendation on June 6, 1983.. Upon roll call, Harris, yes; Rice, yes; Young, yes.

Motion carried.




