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MONDAY, NOVEMBER 30, 1992 CONTINUED 

NOTICE: A complete listing of all information relating to the following 

bids is on file and available for public inspection in the office of County 

Purchasing and County Clerk. 

Sealed bids for New Personal Computers, Printers and Software were received 

and opened. The bidders being six in number are as follow: 

1. Computerland - by item 

2. Actian Computer Supplies - no bid 
3. Software Spectrum no bid 

4. Compuadd no bid 

5S. Moore Business Forms, National Div. no bid 
&. Global Computer Supplies na bid 

Moved by Harris, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to MIS and Purchasing for 

analysis, report and recommendation on December 7, 1992. Upon roll call, 

Harris, yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried. 

Sealed bids for New Computer Hardware were received and opened. The 

bidders being six in number are as follaw: 

1. Computer Savings Corp. Total $3,494.00 

2. Roselius Total $3,495.00 

3. Meridian Leasing Corp. Total $3,535.00 

4. Acquisitions, Inc. Total $3,685.00 
5S. Argecy Financial Corp. no bid 

&. Major Computer, Inc. no bid 

Moved by Harris, seconded by SGelph, to refer bids to MIS and Purchasing for 

analysis, report and recommendation on December 7, 1992. Upon roll call, 

Harris, yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried. 

Sealed bids for Commercial Flat Glass were received and opened. The 

bidders being three in number are as follow: 

1. Horner Glass by item 

e. Harding Glass by item 

3. Robinson Glass by item 

Moved by Harris, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to Purchasing for analysis, 

report and recommendation on December 7, 1992. Upon roll call, Harris, yes; 

Selph, yes. Motion carried. 

Sealed bids for High Pursuit Tires were received and opened. The bidder 

being one in number is as follows: 

1. T & W Tire by item 

Moved by Harris, seconded by Selph, to refer the bid to Tulsa County Central 

Garage and Purchasing for analysis, report and recommendation on December 7, 

1992. Upon roll call, Harris, yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried. 

) Sealed bids for Thirty-Four (34) New Picnic Grills were received and 

opened. The bidders being five in number are as follaw: 

1. Belson Mfg. Co., Inc. 

CC-1200 $70.00 ea. $2,380.00/tatal 
FC-1193 $77.00 ea. $2,618.00/total 

2. Modlin Recreation Equipment, Inc. $78.00 ea. $2,652.00/total 
3. Gary Fain & Associates $114.00 ea. $3,876.00/total 
4. Kay Park Recreation Corp. #78.00 ea. $2,652.00/total 
5S. R. J. Thomas Mfg. Co., Inc. $71.25 ea. $2,422.50/total 
6&. Oklahoma State Industries $77.00 ea. $2,618.00/total 

Moved by Harris, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to Parks and Purchasing for 

analysis, report and recommendation on December 7, 1992. Upon roll call, 

Harris, yes; Selph, yes. Mation carried. 


