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5. Dimension Specialist - 25,000 $798.73

50,000 $1,597.50
4. Systems Service & Supplies, Inc.
25,000 %27.98/M
30,000 $27.98/M
7. PF Business - 23,000 $774.50
, 50,000 $1,549.00
8. Moore Business Forms, Inc.
25,000 $808.00
50,000 $1,606.00
9. Uarco, Inc. - 25,000 $90%.00
50,000 $1,818.00

Moved by Harris, seconded by Rice, to refer bids to Health and Purchasing for
analysis, report and recommendation on May 22, 1989. Upon roll call, Harris,
yes; Rice, yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids, on behalf of Treasurer, for Three (3) New Microfilm Readers
were received and opened. The bidders being nine in number are as follow:

1. Microfilm Service Duplicating no bid

2. The Sanford Company no bid

3. Anacomp, Inc. no bid

4. Documation, Inc. no bid

5. Micrographic Services Total $4,9232.00

6. Dataplex Information Services $3,980.00 each plus

additional lens $273.00 each

7. Z2ytron Corporation Total $4,041.00

8. J. D. Young Company Total $5,850.00

9. B.C.5. Inc. Total $5,046.00

Moved by Harris, seconded by Rice, to refer bids to Treasurer and Purchasing for
analysis, report and recommendation on May 22, 198%9. Upon roll call, Harris,
vyes; Rice, yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids, on behalf of Treasurer, for One (1) New Currency Counter were
received and opened. The bidders being three in number are as follow:

1. F & E Check Protector Company Total $1,730.00

2. Databank Supply & Equipment Total $1,045.00

3. Cummins-Allison Corp. Total $1,%945.00
Moved by Harris, seconded by Rice, to refer bids to Treasurer and Purchasing for
analysis, report and recommendation on May 22, 198%9. Upon roll call, Harris,
yes; Rice, yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids, on behalf of Treasurer, for Carpet were received and opened.

The bidders being four in number are as follow:

1. C & C Tile & Carpet Co. no bid

2. Carpetland, Inc. Total $1,946.00

3. R & R Carpet & Tile Total $2,323.00

4. OGrigsby Carpets - Article 1 Total $2,442.00
Article I1I Total $2,192.00

Moved by Harris, seconded by Rice, to refer bids to Treasurer and Purchasing for
analysis, report and recommendation later this meeting. Upon roll call, Harris,

yes; Rice, yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids, on behalf of Treasurer, for Continuous Data Processing Forms
and Non~Continuous Data Processing Forms Envelopes were received and opened.
The bidders being ten in number are as follow:

1. Wallace Computer Services by item

2. Bowater Computer Forms, Inc. no bid
3. Data Documents by item




