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Moved 

MONDAY, SEPTEMBER 8, 1986, CONTINUED 

by Selph, seconded by Harris, to refer bids to Parks and Purchasing for 

analysis, report and recommendation on September 15, 1986. Upon roll call, 

Rice, yes; Harris, yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried. 

Sealed bids, on behalf of Parks, for Pea Gravel for drainage system at Par 

3 Greens were received and opened. The bidders being two in number are as 

folldw: 

1. A® A Trucking unit price per ton $19.79 delivered 
2. Mohawk Sand & Gravel unit price per ton $19.80 delivered 

Moved by Harris, seconded by Rice, to refer bids to Parks and Purchasing for 

analysis, report and recommendation September 15, 1986. Upon roll call, Rice, 

yes; |Harris, yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried. 

Sealed bids, on behalf of Highway Maintenance, for one (1) New or Used 

Portable Steel Wheeled Compactor were received and opened. The bidders being 

six iin number are as follow: 

1. Midwestern Equipment Co. 
Model 46A Ferguson ~—new $25,385.00 
Model 46A Ferguson —-1985 used $19,720.00 

2. L. B. Smith, Inc. 
new $23,994.16 

. used no bid 

S. Kirby-Smith Machinery, Inc. no bid 
4. Burris Equipment & Supply 

new no bid 

used $20,705.60 

DO. Keystone Equipment Co., Inc. no bid 

6. Albert Equipment Co. no bid 

Moved) by Harris, seconded by Rice, to refer bids to Engineering and Purchasing 

for analysis, report and recommendation on September 15, 1986. Upon roll call, 

Rice,| yes; Harris, yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried. 

pealed bids, on behalf of Highway Construction, for ane (1) used Ceo 

Chevrolet Pickup with utility bid were received and opened. The bidders being 

two iin number are as follow: 

1. Swinson Chevrolet $7,720.00 
Pe. Samuel's & Son's Truck Sales $2,850.00 

Moved] by Harris, seconded by Rice, to refer bids to Engineering and Purchasing 

for analysis, report and recommendation on September 15, 19864. Upon roll call, 

Rice,| yes; Harris, yes; Selph, yes. Motion carried. 

sealed bids, on behalf of Highway Construction, for two (2) new Steel Wheel 

Compattors were received and opened. The bidders being six in number are as 

follow: 

1. Burris Equipment & Supply, Inc. 
1 ~ New Ton Roller, 5-8 ton total $34,838.60 
1 - New 8-10 Ton Roller total $38,938.00 

-. Midwestern Equipment Co. 
1 - New Ton Roller, 5-8 ton total $39,148.00 
1 - New 8-10 Ton Roller total $40,736.00 

8. Keystone Equipment Co. 

1 - New Ton Roller, 5-8 ton total $38,038.00 
1 - New 8-10 Ton Roller total $40,453.00 

4. Albert Equipment Co. 
1 - New Ton Roller, 6-9 ton tandem total $39,772.00 
1 - New 8-10 Ton Roller total $41,533.00 

9- Kirby-Smith Machinery, Inc. no bid 


