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MONDAY, APRIL 25, 1994, CONTINUED

Moved by Selph, seconded by Dick, to accept and file Parks Summary of
Consumable Items Report. Upon roll call, Dick, yes; Selph, yes; Harris, yes.
Motion carried. (Clerk's Misc. File No. 152272)

NOTICE: A complete listing of all information relating to the following
bids is on file and available for public inspection in the office of the County
Purchasing and County Clerk.

Sealed bids for One (1) New Industrial Tractor were received and opened.
The bidders being two in number are as follow:

1. OCT Equipment, Inc. $29,332.00
2. Tulsa Ford New Holland, Inc. no bid

Moved by Selph, seconded by Dick, to refer bids to Engineers and Purchasing for
analysis, report and recommendation on May 2, 1994. Upon roll call, Dick, yes;
Selph, yesj; Harris, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids for Five (3) New GM 5.7L 350K V8 TBl Engines were received and

opened. The bidders being four in number are as follow:

1. Brad Noe Chevrolet $8,000.00 total
2. Keystone Chevrolet $7,500.00 total
3. Classic Chevrolet $7,484.00 total
4. Swinson Chevrolet $7,659.00 total

Moved by Dick, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to Engineers and Purchasing for
analysis, report and recommendation on May 2, 1994. Upon roll call, Dick, yes;
Selph, yes; Harris, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids for One (1) New Compact Calibration Air Supply Unit were
received and opened. The bidders being two in number are as follow:

1., Columbia Scientific Ind. Corp. $3,450.00
2. Thermo Environmental Instruments $3,995.00

Moved by Selph, seconded by Dick, to refer bids to CC Health and Purchasing for
analysis, report and recommendation on May 2, 1994, Upon roll call, Dick, yes;
Selph, yes; Harris, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids for Computer Hardware were received and operned. The bidders

being fifteen in number are as follow:

1. Major Computer International, Inc. $31,250.00
2. ESM Carp. %22, 150.00

3. Acquisitions $27,950.00

4, Cabletron no bid

3. Information Systems Marketing $23,73%9.00

6. Dalton Intl. $26,150.00

7. Microage no bid

8. Argecy no bid

?. Ramtec Information Services no bid
10. Armstec no bid

11. Paramount Computer Leasing Corp. $29,950.00
12. Olympus Corp. $246,800.00

13. Comp. Sales Int'l. $29,921.00
14. Global Computer Corp. %26,240.00

15. Comp. Savings Corp. $23,749.00

Moved by Dick, seconded by Selph, to refer bids to CC Library and Purchasing for
analysis, report and recommendation on May 2, 1994. Upon roll call, Dick, vyes;
Selph, yes; Harris, yes. Motion carried.

Moved by Selph, seconded by Dick, to rescind bid awarded to Safelite Auto

Glass for Automotive Glass Replacement and advertise for bids to be opened on




