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MONDAY, JULY 8, 1996 CONTINUED

3. Social Services Summary of Consumable Items (Clerk's Misc. File No.
160345)

Upon roll call, Selph, yes; Harris, yes; Dick, yes. Motion carried.

NOTICE: A complete listing of all matters relating to the following bids
is on file and available for public inspection in the office of the County
Purchasing and Caunty Clerk.

Sealed bids for One (1) New 744 Ford Front-End Loader were received and

opened. The bidders being two in number are as follow:

1. Tulsa Ford New Holland $6,7923.00
Trade—in Value $3,000.00
2. Enlow Ford Tractor $6,657.65
Trade-in Value $4,000.00

Moved by Selph, seconded by Harris, to refer bids to Highways and Purchasing for
analysis, report and recommendation on July 15, 1996. Upon roll call, Selph,
yes; Harris, yes; Dick, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids for One (1) Used Asphalt Distributor were received and opened.

The bidders being three in number are as follow:

1. Midwestern Equipment Company £62,3500.00
2. G. W. Van Keppel $39,330.00

New 1997 Ford F800 Truck & New Etnyre %73,400.00
3. €EMI Corporation no bid

Moved by Selph, seconded by Harris, to refer bids to Highways and Purchasing for
analysis, report and recommendation on July 15, 19946. Upon roll call, Selph,
yes; Harris, yes; Dick, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids for One (1) New Brush Chipper were received and opened. The

bidders being three in number are as follow:

1. Kirby-Smith Machinery no bid
2. Midwestern Equipment no bid
3. G & R Equipment Company, Inc. $18,200.00

Moved by Selph, seconded by Harris, to refer bids to Highways and Purchasing for
analysis, report and recommendation on July 15, 1996. Upon roll call, Selph,
yes; Harris, yes; Dick, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids for One (1) New or Used Self-Propelled Combination Roller were

received and opened. The bidders being seven in number are as follow:

1. Darr Equipment Company no bid
2. Equipment World, Inc. no bid
3. Prime Equipment Campany no bid
4. TKO Equipment no bid
3. OCT Equipment, Inc. $40,173.35
6. Kirby-Smith Machinery, Inc. $34,990.00
7. Midwestern Equipment Company $48,727.00

Moved by Selph, seconded by Harris, to refer bids to Highways and Purchasing for
analysis, report and recommendation on July 15, 19946. Upon roll call, Selph,
yes; Harris, yes; Dick, yes. Motion carried.

Sealed bids for One (1) Used Single Drum Vibrator Soil Compactor were

received and opened. The bidders being twelve in number are as follow:

l. Kirby-Smith Machinery, Inc. £38,000.00

2. Kirby-Smith Machinery, Inc. $67,000,00

3. Equipment World, Inc. %78,500.00

4. OCT Equipment, Inc. £83,725.00
(New 1996 Without Front Blade)

5. OCT Equipment, Inc. $92,176.00

(New 1996 With Front Blade)
6. Midwestern Equipment Campany $69,169.00




